April 7, 2016

TO: Mayor and City Council

FROM: Larry Ende, Public Works Director
RE: Gravel bids

My recommendation is:
Class 5 Gravel —Hassen Sand and Gravel — FOB and Delivered

Recycled Conbit — Hassen Sand and Gravel — FOB and Delivered
Limestone Class 2 — Bryan Rock - FOB and Delivered

GRAVEL, CONBIT AND LIMESTONE BIDS

CLASS 5 GRAVEL FOB DELIVERED
Hassen Sand and Gravel 2015/$8.75 2016/$8.50 2015/%$13.50 2016/$13.25
Bryan Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Doboszenski No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RECYCLED CONBIT FOB DELIVERED
Hassen Sand and Gravel 2015/$8.75 2016/$8.50 2015/$13.50 2016/$13.25
Bryan Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Doboszenski No Bid 2016/$9.50 | No Bid No Bid
LIMESTONE CLASS 2 FOB DELIVERED
Hassen Sand and Gravel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bryan Rock 2015/%$9.80 2016/$10.10 | 2015/$16.10 2016/$16.50
Doboszenski No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
763-479-0527 (Phone) 1920 County Road 90 7634790528 (Fax)

Independence, MN 55359

http://independence.govoffice.com




“ NNEO@?

April 7,2016

TO: Mayor and City Council

FROM: Larry Ende, Public Works Director
RE: Dust Control

My recommendation is:

Envirotech for dust control

*Note: Only received bids from one company

Dust Control

Magnesium Chloride

FOB

Envirotech

2015/ $0.98

2016/ $0.83
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